
Some people think that it is better to educate boys and girls in separate schools. Others, however, 
believe that boys and girls benefit more from attending mixed schools.

Discuss both these views and give your own opinion.

Studying at single sex or mixed schools is a moot point which most of the parents are dealing with. 
Parents’ mindset is absolutely crucial in their offspring’s nurture.

In my opinion, having successful interactions in future life is one of the most important factors for 
each individual in psychological terms. In other words, everybody should be educated in order to 
establish satisfactory relationships. My firm conviction is that the education at mixed schools has 
much of a role to play in enhancing such abilities. From a social standpoint, pupils studying in these 
schools are more prone to learn a multitude of team working skills from an early age compared to 
their counterparts at separate schools. Therefore, they are consequently not emotionally 
underdeveloped in their relations with the opposite sex. Not only can they advance their social 
knowledge through mixed schools, but also they can gain precious abilities for their personal life. 
Those who experience this kind of education are almost able to realize plenty of distinctions between 
themselves and their partner, so they can find effective solutions more easily in this regard.

On the other hand, some people argue that the environment of single sex schools brings about less 
distractions which in turn leads students to concentrate on their studies significantly. However, 
I opine that such distractions and success are not mutually exclusive since they are inextricably bound 
up with anybody in several sectors of life for instance, at the university and workplace. I strongly 
believe only if everyone attempts to accept all facts of social life, will they succeed in managing most 
of the situations. Moreover, some groups of pupils preferred to study at separate schools since some 
gender prejudices existed in the past and students were limited to choose choosing their favorite 
subjects whilst time hopefully luckily has changed and equality today is allowed at both models of 
schools.

Consequently, further to the above explanation, even though education at mixed schools may has 
have some negative impacts on pupils, I think its advantages outweigh the drawbacks considerably.


